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 * * Warning: This book features a big, tattooed, Dominant alpha male--give him your trust and he'll
command your pleasure. All. Night. Long.* *

Blake Roberts has everything he's ever wanted--fame, money, and ownership of the hottest chain of tattoo
parlors in the country. But he's haunted by his first love, the matching tattoo they share a constant reminder
of who he was before he learned how to control his emotions, his desire, and a woman's pleasure.

He needs to purge her from his heart, and he'll do whatever it takes to be free.

Erin Perry's been burned by love and she's not ready to put her body under a man's control, let alone her
heart. But then Blake shows up, the only man she ever truly loved. Blake is ruthlessly handsome, and
seething commanding energy that has her aching to submit.

To be pleasured, tamed, owned, and put under His control.

Cliffhanger Alert: This steamy read ends in a cliffhanger. If you don't like being teased, steer clear. The
entire UNDER HIS COMMAND series, Erin and Blake's complete love story,  is available now.
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From reader reviews:

Peter Schmidt:

The book Controlling Her Pleasure (Under His Command Book 1) gives you the sense of being enjoy for
your spare time. You can use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can being your best friend
when you getting strain or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make reading a book
Controlling Her Pleasure (Under His Command Book 1) to be your habit, you can get a lot more advantages,
like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You can know
everything if you like wide open and read a guide Controlling Her Pleasure (Under His Command Book 1).
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you
think about this reserve?

Leslie Babcock:

Here thing why this kind of Controlling Her Pleasure (Under His Command Book 1) are different and
reputable to be yours. First of all studying a book is good but it really depends in the content of it which is
the content is as delightful as food or not. Controlling Her Pleasure (Under His Command Book 1) giving
you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any e-book out there but there is no reserve that
similar with Controlling Her Pleasure (Under His Command Book 1). It gives you thrill examining journey,
its open up your own personal eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is perhaps can be
happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your approach home by train.
In case you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Controlling Her Pleasure
(Under His Command Book 1) in e-book can be your substitute.

Terra Runyan:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book can really hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It ok you can have the e-
book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Controlling Her Pleasure (Under His
Command Book 1) which is finding the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.

Marian Buell:

A number of people said that they feel bored when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Controlling Her Pleasure (Under His
Command Book 1) to make your current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading skill is developing when
you similar to reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the impression
about book and reading especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to wide open a book and study it.
Beside that the reserve Controlling Her Pleasure (Under His Command Book 1) can to be your new friend
when you're really feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of that time.
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