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They live in a world divided: in Elysium, on one side of the electro-magnetic Border, reign the Procurators
and Reverands, descendants of early 21st Century power elites and those who aped them; on the other live
the Freelanders, whose democratic city-colonies, including the lesbian settlement of Isis, have established a
safe haven for social progress. Now, as the satellites that maintain the Border threaten to fail, all of Freeland
is menaced by war with Elysium. The women of Isis refuse to wait idly for slaughter. Led by Tomyris
Whitaker and her chief of staff -- and former lover -- Loy Chen, they are attempting to launch a mission to
replace the deteriorating satellites that protect the Border. But General Medusa is convinced that a civilian
task force cannot succeed in this critical mission and challenges their control. As Whitaker and Medusa play
politics, sparks fly between the rival women they have each chosen to pilot the shuttle, Loy Chin and Major
Mika Reno. But the crumbling Border satellites cannot wait for the orderly process of the Council, nor the
disorderly love affairs as the women cling to what may be their last taste of freedom.On the ground, Whit`s
partner, Kali Tyler, works frantically to restore the Border by revising the computer programs her mother
created years ago to protect Freeland. As Whitaker and Kali leave one another, they are fired by memories of
their own mothers` deaths in the previous attack on Isis, and by the desire to live in a free world where they
can raise the child Kali is carrying. As love and duty become one, the lesbians of Isis risk their lives in a
battle of wits and courage that will determine whether women will live free or die enslaved.
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From reader reviews:

Carolyn Livingston:

Here thing why this particular Winged Isis are different and reliable to be yours. First of all examining a
book is good but it really depends in the content of the usb ports which is the content is as tasty as food or
not. Winged Isis giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any guide out there but there
is no e-book that similar with Winged Isis. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your current
eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is probably can be happened around you. You can
easily bring everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your approach home by train. For anyone who
is having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of Winged Isis in e-book can be your
option.

Mary Ybarra:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story as well as their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they
write about advantage about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or
how to teach your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this
world always try to improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write
with their book. One of them is this Winged Isis.

Shawn Calvin:

The book with title Winged Isis has lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of benefit after
read this book. This particular book exist new expertise the information that exist in this reserve represented
the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. That
book will bring you within new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so
you can read the item anywhere you want.

Thomas Moss:

The book untitled Winged Isis contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains the woman idea with
easy method. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy
to read the item. The book was published by famous author. The author will bring you in the new time of
literary works. You can read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read
the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site
and order it. Have a nice go through.
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